Notification of BILLING price determinations or changes

Summary:  You can follow the long thread if you wish but I’ll try to summarize.  In some cases it appears a zero or estimated price is identified as the catalog price for an item by the service or SOS.  I think these are centrally managed, non stocked items.  The actual billing price will be based on the contract price plus appropriate cost recovery factors.  When a customer orders something and estimates a $5.000 price, I believe a customer should have an opportunity to cancel the order prior to the IMM executing an direct vendor order in which the quoted price plus applicable cost recoveries would make the billing price $24.900.  I believe this would be a good opportunity to use the MOV process to confirm the continued need, given an estimated $25,000 billing price before the quote was accepted.  At a minimum, the customer should be advised of the anticipated billing price through some status.  Just a topic for discussion and for ways of improving customer service and reducing “miscommunication”.

==================================
Dennis R. Thomas
Chair, DLMS Finance Process Review Committee
     Defense Logistics Management Standards Office (DLMSO) 
http://www.dla.mil/j-6/dlmso
-----Original Message-----
From: Hilert, Ellen 
Sent: Tuesday, May 13, 2003 11:22 AM
To: Kimberlin, Linda
Cc: Thomas, Dennis
Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB (Unsuccessful Army price challenge of a DLA price)
Linda, If you would like to draft something for us as a proposed change (perhaps focusing on deferred implementation under modernization) we can put it on the agenda for the June 24 Supply PRC meeting
 
 
-----Original Message-----
From: Thomas, Dennis 
Sent: Tuesday, May 13, 2003 11:11 AM
To: Kimberlin, Linda
Cc: Hilert, Ellen
Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB (Unsuccessful Army price challenge of a DLA price)
 

Great, thanks.  Think we may need some supply status related business rules to minimize miscommunications
 
 
-----Original Message-----
From: Kimberlin, Linda 
Sent: Tuesday, May 13, 2003 10:05 AM
To: Thomas, Dennis
Cc: Hilert, Ellen; 'Terry Trepal'
Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB (Unsuccessful Army price challenge of a DLA price)
 

Dennis,
            The catalog files have DLA with a price of $0.00 and AF shows a price of $5,000.00.  The customer used the $5,000.00 price but in the 18 months we took to procure it, we didn’t tell them the acquisition cost had gone to $24,900.00 and that we’d put a 99.9% CRR on it, for a total of $49,700.10 or so.  And because it is an AAC L, SSC 2 item, we won’t put the price on the catalog files.  It will remain $0.00.  How’s that for good customer service?
 
Linda Kimberlin
International Programs Office J-347
HQ DLA  DSN 427-7515 comm'l 703-767-7515
New Email:  Linda.Kimberlin@dla.mil
"If you can't be a good example, then you'll just have to be a horrible warning." Catherine Aird
 
-----Original Message-----
From: Thomas, Dennis 
Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 3:50 PM
To: Kimberlin, Linda
Cc: Hilert, Ellen; 'Terry Trepal'
Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB (Unsuccessful Army price challenge of a DLA price)
 

Linda, 

This topic is similar to our recent e-mail exchanges on pricing and I don’t won’t to extend it further— just want to pass on this exchange for your info if you are interested and have the time.  

I think DLA "might" be using a non-representative price for standard pricing or, if this is not a standard priced item, perhaps, not properly explaining the basis (bill at actual purchase cost + authorized cost recoveries) for the billing price.  The billing unit price (total billing price)/ quantity would be derived.  Is this an example wherein an “estimated price” causes a problem?

 

==================================
Dennis R. Thomas
Chair, DLMS Finance Process Review Committee
     Defense Logistics Management Standards Office (DLMSO) 
http://www.dla.mil/j-6/dlmso
 
-----Original Message-----
From: Thomas, Dennis 
Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 3:31 PM
To: 'HOLTZCLAW, SUSAN (CONTRACTOR)'; 'Sharon Dunfrund (E-mail)'
Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB
 

Susan,

            I was speaking to someone on a similar matter recently.  Seems to me if a standard price applies (whatever rules govern that) then this price challenge should have been successful, if not, then DLA is correct, the acquisition cost (purchase cost +other chargeable costs) would be the billing price and the “estimated” price would be misleading and misinforming the ordering activity.  

I seem to recall if a vendor was asked to produce 100 of an item when his minimum run would normally be say 1,000, the may charge you the same price for 20 @ $50.00 each= $1,000 as he would for a 10,000 @ $0.10 each= $1,000.  In our days, we treated such an example as a non-representative buy, not appropriate for use in standard pricing computations.  If standard pricing did not apply, in the example above the “billing unit price” would be $50 for 20 each or 10 cents for 10,000 each.  I wonder if this could be the situation here. 

The above are just some personal opinions; my knowledge in this area is far too stale to be relied upon.  Anyway, the current DoD price challenge procedures seem a little watered down from the way I remember them . Recommend you check with your Army Log staff  people, perhaps they —whoever covers DoD 4140.1-R, Chapter 2, section 5, perhaps they can contact DLA or someone on the SCI staff if they want to pursue beyond DLA.  http://superreg.lmi.org/supreg 

C2.5.1. Policy. All DoD personnel shall be alert to possible overpricing of materiel. Price challenge and price verification programs shall be established and made available to all DoD personnel, as well as employees of contractors doing work for the Department of Defense. A prompt and adequate assessment shall be made of reported instances of suspected price discrepancies and action taken as necessary to resolve overpricing or overcharging…. 

 

==================================

Dennis R. Thomas

Chair, DLMS Finance Process Review Committee

     Defense Logistics Management Standards Office (DLMSO) 

http://www.dla.mil/j-6/dlmso

 

-----Original Message-----
From: HOLTZCLAW, SUSAN (CONTRACTOR) [mailto:SUSAN.HOLTZCLAW@DFAS.MIL] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 1:06 PM
To: Sharon Dunfrund (E-mail)
Cc: Dennis Thomas (E-mail)
Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

==================================

Dennis R. Thomas

Chair, DLMS Finance Process Review Committee

     Defense Logistics Management Standards Office (DLMSO) 

http://www.dla.mil/j-6/dlmso

 

 

-----Original Message-----
From: HOLTZCLAW, SUSAN (CONTRACTOR) [mailto:SUSAN.HOLTZCLAW@DFAS.MIL] 
Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 1:06 PM
To: Sharon Dunfrund (E-mail)
Cc: Dennis Thomas (E-mail)
Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

  Doesn't appear that the price challenge works very well with DLA.  Is there anywhere else we can take this problem?  

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Holderfield, Ken - G8 [mailto:holderfk@forscom.army.mil]

Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 12:22 PM

To: 'Swanson, Bill'; HOLTZCLAW, SUSAN (CONTRACTOR)

Cc: Pharr, William - G8

Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

Sue/Bill, Here's an item you two should be aware of.

 

On Jan 23 a unit at Ft Hood ordered 20 lock washers for a vehicle trailer

for stockage in their PLL.  These were plain zinc lock washers less than 1"

in diameter.  The AMDF price at the time of order was $.10 each.

 

On March 11 Ft Hood received a bill from AJ2 for the items totaling

$8,240.00, $412 for each lock washer.

 

A quick review of the AMDF shows a March price of $412 each.  That price is

still on the May AMDF.

 

Ft DOL challenged the billed price believing it was an obvious error.  We

also ran it through our DLA rep here at FORSCOM who told us that DLA has

revised their billing price to $1 each.

 

The DLA response to the price challenge in attached.  They claim that the

charge is legitimate.  Patti Brown and I just spoke with the POC on the memo

for clarification of how much should have been charged.

 

Ms. Szarek implied there was a $250 minimum order associated with this item.

It seems at most the field would have to pay $250 for these 20 washers.

 

One thing was clear from our conversation was that she didn't understand the

impact of the prices in FEDLOG.  She kept saying that the 10 cent price in

FEDLOG was only an estimate.

 

She is looking into this particular issue further and said she would get

back to us within a couple of days.   

 

 

Bill, of particular interest in the second paragraph that you should not is

the following comment: "The Acquisition Advice Code (AAC) is "J" meaning the

item is centrally managed but a non-stocked item."  Their interpretation

seems to conflict with the ruling you provided on the DLA containers

recently.

-----Original Message-----

From: Brown, Patti--RM [mailto:Patti.Brown@hood.army.mil] 

Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 10:15 AM

To: Holderfield, Ken - G8; Elkins, Martin --DOL

Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

Ken/Marty

 

Attached is the response Clarence got on this price challenge. Talking with

him, as near as I could follow, was that a quantity of 1 cost $250.00, sort

of a "first time buyer" fee even though this was not a first time contract,

and the 20 cost 51 cents. The $412.00 unit price was based on the cost of 1

at $250.00, however, the letter admits the 20 only cost 51 cents.

 

 

Patti Brown 

 

Financial Administration and Program Analyst 

ACofS, RM 

Fort Hood 

DSN: 737-6680 

Comm: 254-287-6680 

 

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Holderfield, Ken - G8 [mailto:holderfk@forscom.army.mil]

Sent: Tuesday, May 06, 2003 2:13 PM

To: Brown, Patti--RM

Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

Patti, I just checked the price on the DLA website and it now shows $1 unit

price for these washers.  Appears to me to be in a unit of 100.  ??

 

Let me know who needs to be dealt with in AJ2 if you need assistance to get

your money back.

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Brown, Patti--RM [mailto:Patti.Brown@hood.army.mil] 

Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2003 2:53 PM

To: Holderfield, Ken - G8

Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

Ken,

 

Enlightening (NOT)

 

Patti Brown 

 

Financial Administration and Program Analyst 

ACofS, RM 

Fort Hood 

DSN: 737-6680 

Comm: 254-287-6680 

 

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Durham, Clarence 13C 

Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2003 1:51 PM

To: Brown, Patti--RM

Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

I e-mailed the person who is to give us an answer and he flatly said that he

had 90 days to respond to a challenge. I guess we will just have to wait.  I

hope noone needs any lock washers.

 

Clarence Durham

Systems Analyst

287-3536

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Brown, Patti--RM 

Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2003 1:44 PM

To: Durham, Clarence 13C

Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, Bill #E8DTB

 

 

Clarence,

 

This is the niin (well, one of them) that we had you challenge earlier in

March. I asked you when we got the bill if you had heard anything, and you

had not at that time. Have you heard anything since? I've elevated this to

FORSCOM and this is what their DLA rep found out. Is this Price Verification

Request he mentions the same thing that you did through LOGSA?

 

Patti Brown 

 

Financial Administration and Program Analyst 

ACofS, RM 

Fort Hood 

DSN: 737-6680 

Comm: 254-287-6680 

 

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Greene, Phillip - G4 DLA [mailto:greenep@forscom.army.mil]

Sent: Tuesday, April 22, 2003 11:46 AM

To: Holderfield, Ken - G8

Cc: Pharr, William - G8; Brown, Patti--RM; Bagley, Judy - G4; Campbell,

David - G4

Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, BIll #E8DTB

 

 

Hmmm, Interesting. The Dla Standard Unit price listed is 1.00 EA but you are

correct FEDLOG shows 412.00. I will look into it. Unit can also do a Price

Verification Request and that will fix it as well and get them billed

correctly...

 

Phil

 

Philip M. Greene

DLA - Corporate Liaison FORSCOM

DSN 367.6595

Comm 404.464.6595

FAX 6750

"Sometimes I have moments of lucidity...I'm not sure just when......"

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Holderfield, Ken - G8 

Sent: Monday, April 21, 2003 4:16 PM

To: Greene, Phillip - G4 DLA

Cc: Pharr, William - G8; Brown, Patti--RM; Bagley, Judy - G4; Campbell,

David - G4

Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, BIll #E8DTB

 

Phil, here's an interesting one for you.

 

Unit ordered 20 of the lock washer's below for $.10 each.  When they

received the bill it was for $8,240. Appears the price was changed to $412

around Feb.  Hard to imagine that a 3/4 inch diameter washer actually costs

$412, especially one for a generator trailer.

 

So far, the IMMC says the price is correct.  Can we get a better explanation

for this increase in price?

 

----------------------------------------------------------------

 

Army Master Data File Response for NSN  5310-01-473-6844

Item Name: WASHER,LOCK

Nomenclature: WASHER,LOCK

 ACT  ADDL   SOS  AAC  PS   UNIT PRICE  UI  FC  UM  MEAS-QTY  EIC  EC

             S9I   J            412.00  EA                         G

 SCMC  AEC  MATCAT    LIN    LCC  RICC  ARC  SRC  SCIC  CIIC  ICC  SLC

  9T    1   T2200             R    0     X         0     U     4    0

 ARI  ARI RIC(S)            DML   ADP   PMI   MR    RC   ESDC  HMIC  CC

                             A                Z     Z           N   X

 

Supplier Data Response for NSN  5310-01-473-6844

Item Name: WASHER,LOCK

 

CAGE Code: 0VKD6    Status: F    Type: F    CAO: S1103A         ADP: HQ0339

 

Company Name and Address:

MR METRIC INC

 

 

                                                  Phone:

TUCKER GA  30084-3051                               FAX:

UNITED STATES

RPLM Code:                     ASSOC Code:                     AFFIL Code:

SIZE:        Primary Business:        Type of Business:        Women Owned:

SIC Codes:

 

Characteristics Data Response for NSN  5310-01-473-6844

Item Name: WASHER,LOCK

 MRC   Requirement Statement          Clear Text Reply 

NAME   ITEM NAME                      WASHER,LOCK                         

AAUB   HOLE DIAMETER                  10.2 MILLIMETERS NOMINAL

ABKV   OUTSIDE DIAMETER               18.1 MILLIMETERS NOMINAL

ABPX   MATERIAL THICKNESS             2.2 MILLIMETERS NOMINAL

AGAV   END ITEM IDENTIFICATION        6115-01-317-2139;GENERATOR SET,     

                                      DIESEL ENGINE,TRAILER               

CQFM   HARDNESS RATING                44.0 ROCKWELL C MINIMUM AND 51.0    

                                      ROCKWELL C MAXIMUM

MATT   MATERIAL                       STEEL OVERALL

SFTT   SURFACE TREATMENT              ZINC OVERALL

STYL   STYLE DESIGNATOR               108 SPLIT HELICAL-RIGHT HAND        

 

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Brown, Patti--RM [mailto:Patti.Brown@hood.army.mil] 

Sent: Monday, April 21, 2003 3:21 PM

To: Holderfield, Ken - G8

Subject: FW: W34QV930230009, BIll #E8DTB

 

 

 

 

Patti Brown 

 

Financial Administration and Program Analyst 

ACofS, RM 

Fort Hood 

DSN: 737-6680 

Comm: 254-287-6680 

 

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: GREEN, CATHERINE L [mailto:CATHERINE.L.GREEN@DFAS.MIL]

Sent: Friday, March 21, 2003 7:03 AM

To: Patti Brown (E-mail)

Cc: SMITH, EVELYN L; PIERCE, DAVID

Subject: RE: W34QV930230009, BIll #E8DTB

 

 

 

FYI

>  -----Original Message-----

> From:     PETERSON, LORI  

> Sent:     Thursday, March 20, 2003 4:51 PM

> To: GREEN, CATHERINE L

> Cc: SMITH, EVELYN L; PIERCE, DAVID

> Subject:  RE: W34QV930230009, BIll #E8DTB

> 

> Catherine,

> 

> It does look like this is correct.  This is an AAC J, which is a

"non-stocked item".  

> 

> 

> 

> Lori

> 

>      -----Original Message-----

>     From:       GREEN, CATHERINE L  

>     Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2003 1:34 PM

>     To:   PETERSON, LORI

>     Cc:   SMITH, EVELYN L; PIERCE, DAVID

>     Subject:    W34QV930230009, BIll #E8DTB

> 

>     Lori,

> 

>     This item is a lock washer originally proced at $.10 each, however,

this bill the unit price is $412.00 each.  Will you please research and see

if we have been overcharged.  

> 

>     FS1 00297X4930AC6UAJ2        W34QV9303 E8DTBW9046W 312132020

000824160

>     FA1WJC 5310014736844  EA00020W34QV930230009 W45J67J31E8DTB4

0660008240000041200

> 

>     Thanks,

> 

> 

>     Catherine L. Green

>     Lead Accounting Technician, Ft Hood Team

>     DFAS LAWTON FIELD SITE

>     DSN:  639-0330

>     CML:  (580)442-0330

>     FAX:  639-1012 or (580)442-1012

>     EMAIL:  Catherine.L.Green@DFAS.MIL

> 

 

 

-----

Message-ID:

<94DDBB89460C3C438B1B49A9C34839AC050EDB7B@n3cdoimmail50m.hood.army.mil>

From: "Durham, Clarence 13C" <Clarence.Durham@hood.army.mil>

To: "Brown, Patti--RM" <Patti.Brown@hood.army.mil>

Cc: "Arsenault, Debbie--RM" <Debbie.Arsenault@hood.army.mil>

Subject: FW: Price Challenge Request NSN 5310-01-473-6844/2213

Date: Wed, 7 May 2003 08:48:16 -0500 

X-Mailer: Internet Mail Service (5.5.2656.59)

 

I think the bill that was sent for the 20 should be challenged since the

attached letter states that they got those at .51 each plus the recovery

cost.  The price is supposed to be $1.00 now. Our price has not been changed

as of yet so I do not know when the AMDF will change.

 

Clarence Durham

Systems Analyst

287-3536

 

 

-----Original Message-----

From: Szarek, Gloria (DSCP) [mailto:Gloria.Szarek@dla.mil]

Sent: Wednesday, May 07, 2003 8:24 AM

To: 'clarence.durham@hood.army.mil'

Cc: 'hotline@logsa.army.mil'

Subject: Price Challenge Request NSN 5310-01-473-6844/2213

 

 

Attached is the response to subject price challenge

 

 <<2213.doc>> 

 

Gloria Szarek

Contract Integrity Office

DSCP-PPI

215-737-5297

215-737-2620 (Fax)

Gloria.Szarek@dla.mil

PLEASE NOTE MY EMAIL HAS CHANGED

